Real Time Gross Settlement (RTGS) / NEFT Funds Transfer Requisition Form#*
(To be filled in by the Applicant-in Block Letters)

Bank : Syndicate Bank Branch : Surampalem Date: 25.01.2021
" |Name of the Ordering Customer (Remitter) SAROJINI EDUCATIONAL SOCIETY
Account Number of the Customer '32683070000017

Cheque Number

Rs.111300/-
Amount to be remitted ;

_:,Rupees in words: One lakh Eleven thousand three’hundred
Only - :

Any others information relevant to ordering customer

Full Name of the Beneficiary to whom funds are to be  |THE REGISTRAR INTUA CONSORTIA OF E
remitted RESOURCES

Name of the Beneficlary Bank . STATE BANK OF INDIA

Name of the Beneficiary Bank Branch and Place
_ |GEC (INTUEC)

IFSC code of the Beneficiary Bank '
’ SBIN0002723

‘Account Number of Beneficiary"to which funds are to be

remitted 39076492371

Any other relevart information of Beneficiary / payment |Mircromedix software for Pharfn D students for
details Annum (ACP) ! /

Remit the amount as per above details, by debiting my / our account for the amount of remittance plus you
charges.# GRS

# Conditions of Transfer:

1. The Remitting Bank shall not be liable for any loss or damage arising or resulting fféh%;;ﬁiéla*;g:m;... '
transmission delivery or non - delivery: of Electronic message or mistake, omission or error in.transmission
of delivery thereof or in deciphering the message: from any cause whatsoever of from its misinterpretation

received or the'action of the destination Bank or any act or even beyond control.

2. All the payment instructions shall be checked carefully by the remitter.

3. Messages received after the cut-of time will be sent on the next working day.
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ACOP Office <office@acop.edu.in>

Micromedex Software for our pharmacy Colleges - Reg
2 messages

ACOP Office <office@acop.edu.in> Wed, Jan 27, 2021 at 11:38 AM
To: dirap@jntua.ac.in

Respected Sir,
Good I\/‘Iorning,'

We have contributed Micromedex Software for our both Pharmacy Colleges Aditya Pharmacy College and
Aditya College of Pharmacy and the details are given below.

S.No. Name of the College Name of the software | Amount Rs. Online Transaction No. &
Date
1 Aditya Pharmacy Micromedex 1,11,300.00 P025210084342089,
College dated 25.01.2021
2 Aditya College of Micromedex 1,11,300.00 P025210084342534,
Pharmacy dated 25.01.2021

Kindly provide us the user id and password details at the earliest possible.
Thanking you,

Yours truly,

Dr. K. Ravishankar

2 attachments

@ ADITYA COLLEGE OF PHARMACY.pdf
133K

%) ADITYA PHARMACY COLLEGE.pdf
Y 133K

dirap Jntua <dirap@jntua.ac.in> Wed, Jan 27, 2021 at 12:07 PM
To: ACOP Office <office@acop.edu.in>

Thank-you sir. We will update you in a day or two.

Thanks,

Prof.V. Sumalatha |

Director, Industrial Relations & Placements (/(/\/\'(/V\/_—

JNTU Anantapur /7(

8008802559 .

[Quoted text hidden] i - .
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®
Gma;‘ Dr. K RAVI SANKAR a <principal@acop.edu.in>

Fwd: Micron’iede)é logi.ﬁ credentials '(Stahd'by'j o

Dr. K RAVI SANKAR a <principal@acop.edu.in> Fri, Mar 12, 2021 at 3:32 PM
To: amit.britind@gmail.com, harithaajay14@gmail.com, penugondavineela@gmail.com

———————— Forwarded message -———-——

From: dirap Jntua <dirap@jntua.ac.in>

Date: Fri, Mar 12, 2021 at 3:05 PM

Subject: Fwd: Micromedex login credentials (Standby)

To: <manoharsitty@yahoo.co.in>, <rahamanphd@gmail.com>, <svidyadhara@gmail.com>, <hcopgnt@gmail.com>,
<drgovindarajanr@gmail.com>, <lcpprincipal@gmail.com>, <gollapalli_s@yahoo.com>, <profprrau@gmail.com>, ;
<srinivasaraocollegeofpharmacy@gmail.com>, Dr. M.D.Dhanaraju <mddhanaraju@yahoo.com>, Principal VIPS <principalvips@gmail.com>,

<dremchetty@gmail.com>, Creative Educational Societys College of Pharmacy Y0 <principal.yO@jntua.ac.in>, Swathi College of Pharmacy
SN <Principal.9n@jntua.ac.in>, Dr.Muralidhar Avula <principal.sjcps@gmail.com>, <principal.npc4q@gmail.com>,
<nelsonfielpsu@yahoo.co.in>, <office@adityapharmacy.edu.in>, <principal@acop.edu.in>, <vijayapharmacyfw@gmail.com>,
<principalvnip20@gmail.com>, <ysrvignan@gmail.com>, <psbabu1@yahoo.co.in>, <koringacollegeofpharmacy@yahoo.com>, Bhavani
Boddeda <bhavani2008@gmail.com>, Koringa College of Pharmacy <koringacollege@gmail.com>

Dear Sir/Madam,

I'am forwarding the mail received from Mr. Amarnath regarding Micromedix standy login credentials. Regular credentials will be activated
shortly. :

Thanks,

Prof. V. Sumalatha

Director, Industrial Relations & Placements
JNTU Anantapur

Dear sir / Madam,

Thank you for your decision to subscribe to Micromedex clinical Knowledge solutions. The order process is taking time because of the new
approvals required for the short fall in the no of colleges. Nevertheless, It will be resolved at the earliest. Request your cooperation in this
Jard.

However, in case of any emergency requirements, Please find below the standby login credentials(common Id) to access Micromedex till your
regular login is activated.

URL: www.micromedexsolutions.com

Username: RED
Password: 7hld#+rl5ayEy9pr

(Kindly note that the password is case sensitive. Once you login, click on the "Micromedex" button to access the home page
of Micromedex.
Do let us know if you have any issues in accessing the info.

Thanks & Regards,
Amarnath N
DaiKnow Pvt Ltd
Bengaluru: 560078 o~
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